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CASE SUMMARY
A 71-year-old woman with a his-

tory of hypertension, hyperlipid-
emia, and atrial fibrillation presented 
to the emergency department with 
acute, severe left flank and pelvic 
pain, nausea, and emesis. She denied 
hematuria, dysuria, and NSAID use. 
Vital signs were normal. She had 
pain with abdominal palpation. Uri-
nalysis demonstrated 1+ leukocytes, 
2+ blood, and no casts or infection. 
Creatinine was elevated from 1.1 to 
3.17 mg/dL. Noncontrast CT abdo-
men and pelvis confirmed the etiol-
ogy of her pain. One year prior to this 
admission, she had a similar presenta-
tion and was diagnosed with ureteral 
obstruction causing unilateral hydro-
ureteronephrosis. She was treated con-
servatively as her symptoms resolved 
without intervention. On this recent 
admission, urology recommended 
cystoscopy and ureteral stenting. Ret-
rograde pyelography demonstrated a 
tortuous left ureter near the sacroil-
iac joint. Purulent fluid was drained 
with guidewire insertion, and a dou-
ble-J stent was placed. The creatinine 
declined postoperatively, and her pain 
resolved.  

IMAGING FINDINGS
Noncontrast-enhanced CT demon-

strated moderate left hydrouretero-
nephrosis and left ureter coursing 
laterally into the sciatic notch ventral 
to neurovascular structures with an 
abrupt change in caliber suggesting 
impingement (Figures 1). CT three-di-
mensional reconstruction demon-
strated the course of the ureter and its 
entrapment in the sciatic notch (Figure 
3). Retrograde pyelography demon-
strated horizontally redundant ureter in 
the sciatic notch (Figure 2). 

DIAGNOSIS 
Ureterosciatic hernia 

DISCUSSION
Sciatic hernias are the rarest type 

of pelvic floor herniation with 99 total 
cases identified through 2008.1 The 
sacrospinous and sacrotuberous liga-
ments divide the sciatic notch into the 
greater and lesser sciatic foramina.1,2 
The piriformis divides the greater sci-
atic foramen into the suprapiriform 
foramen and infrapiriform foramen.1,2 
Sciatic hernias are more commonly 
suprapiriform, but can also arise in 
the infrapiriform foramen or the lesser 

sciatic foramen. Of the reported sci-
atic hernias, 77% were in women 
and 37% were in patients 60 years or 
older.1 Organs that can herniate into 
the greater or lesser sciatic foramen 
include ovary (28%), ureter (25%), 
small intestine (23%), and colon 
(18%).1,2 

The most common location of ure-
teral herniation is inguinal, whereas 
sciatic, thoracic, and parailiac hernias 
are seldom reported.2 Ureterosciatic 
hernia is exceedingly rare with fewer 
than 40 cases reported in the literature. 
Atrophy of the piriformis secondary to 
hip pathology or neuromuscular dis-
eases likely contributes to this etiology 
of ureterosciatic hernia.2  

Presentation typically includes 
acute abdominal pain, flank pain, 
nausea/vomiting, and possible renal 
pathology secondary to the ureteral 
obstruction.3,4 The patient described in 
this case developed acute renal failure 
and pyelonephritis secondary to the 
obstruction. However, patients may 
also be asymptomatic.5 

Ureterosciatic hernias cannot 
reliably be diagnosed with physical 
examination.2,4 Imaging with CT or 
pyelography is essential for diagnosis. 
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FIGURE 3.  Three-dimensional CT reconstruction of the abdo-
men and pelvis demonstrates the dilated left ureter trapped in 
the sciatic notch. 

FIGURE 1. Noncontrast axial (A) and sagittal (B) CT of the abdomen and pelvis demonstrating the left ureter herniated through the sciatic notch. 

FIGURE 2. Fluoroscopic retrograde pyelogram reveals a tortuous left ure-
ter with obstruction. The classic “curlicue sign” of ureterosciatic hernia is 
demonstrated.
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Anterograde or retrograde pyelogra-
phy reveals horizontally redundant 
ureter posterolateral and inferior to 
the ischial spine.3 This presentation 
is known as the “curlicue” sign and is 
pathognomonic for ureterosciatic her-
nia.3 CT demonstrates the ureter poste-
rior, lateral, and craniad to the ischial 
spine.6 CT can also reveal hydrouret-
eronephrosis proximal to the hernia 
secondary to obstruction, which was 
demonstrated in this case. CT with 
three-dimensional reconstruction and 
volume rendering can also be used to 
confirm the diagnosis and appreciate 
hernia location before surgical inter-
vention.4 

There are various treatment options, 
depending on the patient’s presenta-
tion. The asymptomatic patient can 
be treated conservatively with obser-
vation.5 The symptomatic patient can 
be treated with ureteral stenting to 
maintain patency of the affected ure-
ter.5 The stent can be removed after 
symptoms resolve. If stenting is not 
successful, symptomatic patients can 

be treated with ureteropexy or uretero-
ureterostomy.5

CONCLUSION
Sciatic hernias are a very rare type 

of pelvic floor hernia. Ureterosciatic 
herniation should be in the differen-
tial when the patient presents with 
the acute onset nausea/vomiting, col-
icky flank pain, abdominal pain, and 
reduced renal function. CT imaging 
with or without contrast confirms the 
diagnosis by demonstrating the ureter 
in the greater sciatic foramen postero-
lateral to the ischial spine and anterior 
to the piriformis. Pyelography demon-
strating the “curlicue” sign is pathog-
nomonic. This patient had resolution 
of symptoms and acute renal failure 
after ureter displacement from the 
greater sciatic foramen and double-J 
stent placement. 
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